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2) That we will come together soon to pray and work on it, we do not want to slacken a day or an hour. 
Tomorrow morning our way will  lead us again to Lloyd Trestino, maybe once more to the benefit 
Society. As soon as we learn something new, you will know it soon. We had a postcard from  Mrs 
Mainzer today, please write her your new address right now. She wrote to the old one and says it had 
not arrived. By the way, we do not know Hanni’s new address either. On the 13th, the transport to 
Palestine is finally to leave, with which the Homburgers also want to go. I would be especially happy for 
Margot, who would be happy if she were in your place, as would the two Lottes here, who always ask 
about you. We often visit Aunt Else. Thank her again for the birthday letter, maybe I will send it again 
occasionally. You are quite right to want to write a dear letter to Aunt Lilly. We have no reason to hurt 
her, but Aunt Else could well use a little contribution from every possible source. The money Lilly sent to 
Lazarussens was far from the full amount. If Lilly and Anna sent a little something now and then, they 
would not hurt themselves and would do her a great deal of good. The friendship with Hertha makes 
me happy, too, also that she gave you something for your birthday is very sweet. Her mother hopes to 
join her son in the Union soon – with the help of the Benefit Society by the Swiss Red Cross. So that is  
also a way to get to Africa. We will inquire accordingly. The fact that Edith was in the hospital for a few 
days shocked me a little. But the winter was so unseasonably cold, apparently all over the world. It was 
a miracle to get through it in one piece. We both had colds once, too, and Eugenie is now. She was at 
home on White Sunday,  Paul  went to communion, Kathrin in Bommersheim as well. Little  Joseph 
Häusser had an operation on his appendix. I visited him in the Marienkrankenhaus (hospital). By the 
way, Dr Stamm is still here, great exception. I was very shocked by the death of Manet Bender, but 
unfortunately there is so much that is shocking. Have you heard from Alice? What about Ernst D. and 
Schames? What does Edith Baum do? A fortnight ago, Mrs Rina visited me. She already knew about 
Manet. I also met Lullu Schames this week. She told me that her brother had organized a successful 
exhibition. So maybe luck will come to him, too. Are you still going to the countess? How is your art?  
Can one still get flowers from you and if so which ones? Here, many are still produced and taught in 
courses. It is nice that you are learning to dance. How many boys and girls take part? You can learn a lot 
more when we will be together again, my little one. It is great, that Fritz is now with Dad and Helmut, 
too. We can study everything once we will be together in Africa! Because Edith wrote you would enjoy 
learning and you would like to continue learning. What would your teachers in Homburg say if they 
knew that? By the way, I read in a Homburg newspaper that Mechthild Kneipp graduated from high 
school,  and maybe two more from your class.  Then you will  be interested to know that  Gertrud 
Scherfenberg married a noble doctor. We have not been to Homburg for a while. Melanie often comes 
to us on Wednesday afternoons, when I also have my day off. Aunt Bertha is quite well again, Uncle 
Sally does not look very well. Anything from Elsbeth? She has done very well with her employment. 
Bendheims have been ordered to Stuttgart on April, 19th. Then they want to leave immediately. We 
took Flora Vogel to the train on Wednesday afternoon. Yesterday she left for the USA from Genua. So 
one after the other goes. It is almost 11 p.m., everyone is already in bed. I will finish writing now. Aunt 
Flora will continue writing in the morning. Before I will fall asleep I will have a long conversation with all 
of you in my thoughts, with you, my beloved child. May God continue to protect you and keep you 
healthy.  Do not  forget  Dad’s  birthday on May 10th.  It  takes  a  long time for  mail  to  arrive.  1000 
affectionate kisses for you, my beloved. Many grateful greetings for Uncle Benno, for Mrs. Frank and for 
all who are good to you. Warmest regards,

 Bella



The handwritten part of the letter

Summary in English:

Dear Ellchen, dear Benno,

Just now, Monday morning I received the cancellation from Hamburg. I am very shocked, but it does 
not help. We have to keep our heads up. We have to go to the Italian line. The consul wrote, … I 
regret to inform you that the Ministry refused the necessary authorization, so that I am unable to 
issue the document requested for you and your sister Flora. I feel sorry … There is still a possibility 
that the Ministry in Lisbon can still be convinced by the council to give you a transit visa. 

This is the reality.





… in German

Liebes Ellchen, lieber Benno, eben Montag früh kommt die Absage von Hamburg, ich bin sehr 
erschrocken, doch hilft es nichts, wir müssen den Kopf oben behalten. Jetzt gehen wir zur 
italienischen Linie an Papa (?) …? Der Konsul schreibt wörtlich: … muss ich Ihnen leider mitteilen, dass 
das Ministerium die erforderliche Genehmigung versagt hat, sodass ich nicht in der Lage bin, das für 
Sie und Ihre Schwester Flora beantragte Passvisum für … auszustellen. Ich bedaure -----

… Möglichkeit, dass der portugiesischen Behörde in ?? doch noch das –ministerium in Lissabon 
überzeugen können, die Genehmigung zur Visums--- zu geben. Das ist die Realität.


